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Anselm Strauss: Understanding the Complex
Relationship
In the world of psychology and mental health, the study of psychiatric ideologies
and institutions plays a crucial role in the understanding and treatment of various
mental disorders. One of the prominent figures who had a significant impact in
this field is Anselm Strauss. In this article, we will explore the life of Anselm
Strauss, his contributions, and the complex relationship between psychiatric
ideologies and institutions.

to Psychiatric Ideologies and Institutions

Psychiatric ideologies refer to the belief systems, theories, and perspectives that
shape the understanding and approach towards mental health. Institutions, on the
other hand, represent the organized structures and establishments responsible
for the treatment and care of individuals with mental disorders.

The relationship between psychiatric ideologies and institutions is complex and
intertwined. The ideologies held by mental health professionals influence the
strategies, practices, and policies adopted in institutions. At the same time, the
functioning and operations of institutions can also shape the ideologies within the
field.
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Anselm Strauss - A Pioneer in Understanding Psychiatric Ideologies
and Institutions

Anselm Strauss was a highly influential sociologist and researcher, known for his
groundbreaking work in the field of symbolic interactionism, sociology of
knowledge, and medical sociology. Born in 1916, he dedicated his career to
studying the intricate relationship between individuals, society, and mental health
institutions.

Strauss was particularly interested in understanding how psychiatric ideologies
not only shape the methods of treatment but also impact the lives of individuals
with mental disorders. His work shed light on the subjective experiences of
patients within institutional settings, challenging the dominant biomedical
perspective prevalent at the time.

The Three Worlds of Psychiatric Ideologies

In his seminal work, "The Social Construction of Psychiatric Ideologies," Strauss
put forward the concept of the "Three Worlds" that psychiatric ideologies operate
within.
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The First World encompasses the dominant biomedical perspective that focuses
on biological factors and medical interventions for mental health issues. This
perspective often prioritizes the use of medication and medical treatments as the
primary approach to psychiatric care.

The Second World involves the psychodynamic perspective, which emphasizes
the role of unconscious processes, childhood experiences, and the dynamics of
personal relationships in mental health. Psychodynamic theories heavily
influenced the practice of psychiatry during the mid-20th century.

The Third World represents the social and cultural perspective, highlighting the
influence of societal factors, cultural norms, and social structures on mental
health. This perspective emphasizes the importance of social support,
understanding cultural differences, and considering the broader social context in
mental health care.

According to Strauss, these worlds often coexist and interact within psychiatric
ideologies, and their dominance can vary across different time periods and
institutions.

Impact on Mental Health Institutions

The ideologies held by mental health professionals significantly impact the
operation and functioning of mental health institutions. Institutions that emphasize
the biomedical perspective may prioritize medication over therapy, leading to a
more medicalized approach towards mental health.

Alternatively, institutions that adopt the psychodynamic perspective may focus on
uncovering unconscious conflicts and engaging in therapeutic interventions such
as psychoanalysis. This approach emphasizes understanding the root causes of
mental health issues and exploring the patient's past experiences.



Furthermore, institutions that adopt the social and cultural perspective may
prioritize community support, involvement of families, and addressing systemic
issues that contribute to mental health problems. These institutions emphasize
the importance of social inclusion and reducing stigma surrounding mental
disorders.

The Complex Relationship

The relationship between psychiatric ideologies and institutions is not one-sided;
institutions also shape the ideologies within the field. The practices and policies
enforced within institutions can influence the beliefs and perspectives of mental
health professionals.

For instance, if a psychiatric institution heavily promotes the use of medication as
the primary treatment, mental health professionals working in that institution may
develop a biomedical perspective and prioritize medication-based interventions in
their practice.

Conversely, mental health professionals who work in institutions that emphasize
therapeutic approaches may develop a psychodynamic perspective and
approach their practice with an emphasis on understanding unconscious
processes.

Moreover, the socioeconomic and cultural factors surrounding mental health care
also influence the relationship between psychiatric ideologies and institutions.
Insurance policies, government regulations, and cultural beliefs can shape the
ideologies of mental health professionals and the operation of institutions.

Anselm Strauss's work on psychiatric ideologies and institutions paved the way
for a better understanding of the complex relationship between these two entities.



His research highlighted the importance of considering multiple perspectives and
recognizing the influence of institutions on psychiatric ideologies.

By understanding this relationship, we can strive to create mental health
institutions that embrace a holistic approach, taking into account biological,
psychological, sociocultural, and systemic factors. This understanding allows us
to provide comprehensive and effective care to individuals with mental disorders,
ensuring their well-being and recovery.
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The authors of this volume point out that what is ordinarily termed the psychiatric
hospital's "social structure" is principally derived from three sources: the number
and kinds of professionals who work there; the treatment ideologies and
professional identities of these professionals; and the relationships of the
institution and its professionals to outside communities, both professional and lay.
They describe hospitals as sites where ideological battles characterizing the
mental health arena are being fought, implemented, critiqued, modified, and
transformed.
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This classic monograph in medical sociology was originally published in the
1960s. The period studied was 1958 through 1963, when somatic and
psychotherapeutic ideologies were flourishing—as now—and milieutherapy was
just emerging. The research team was multidisciplinary: three sociologists, one
psychologist, and one psychiatrist.

Three distinct psychiatric environments were researched: two at the Chicago
State Hospital—"chronic services" and "treatment services"—and one at a private
hospital. What evolved were thoughtful comparative analyses of hospitals, wards,
professionals, ideological positions, careers, and organizational and situational
placements.
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