
Steve Bannon, Donald Trump, and The
Nationalist Uprising
In recent years, the rise of nationalistic movements has been a topic of intense
discussion and debate. One of the influential figures behind this movement is
Steve Bannon, a former advisor to Donald Trump. Bannon's influence on Trump's
presidency and his involvement in nationalist movements around the world have
made him a polarizing figure in modern politics.

Steve Bannon, a media executive and political strategist, first gained prominence
as the executive chairman of Breitbart News, a far-right news and opinion
website. Under Bannon's leadership, Breitbart became a platform for promoting
conservative and nationalist ideas, often criticized for its controversial and divisive
coverage. Bannon gained a reputation for his fiery rhetoric and his support for
populism, which resonated with a significant portion of the American electorate.

However, Bannon's influence skyrocketed when he became the chief strategist
and senior counselor to President Donald Trump in 2016. As a key member of
Trump's team, Bannon played a crucial role in shaping the administration's
policies and messaging. His nationalist agenda, emphasizing issues such as
immigration, trade, and national security, aligned with Trump's vision of making
America "great again."

Devil's Bargain: Steve Bannon, Donald Trump, and
the Nationalist Uprising by Joshua Green (Kindle Edition)

4.4 out of 5
Language : English
File size : 1513 KB
Text-to-Speech : Enabled
Screen Reader : Supported

http://dl.neutronbyte.com/pdf-file/Wa18oYTP/e/wjkK/OPMw/gqQxP/Devils-Bargain-Steve-Bannon-Donald-Trump-and-the-Nationalist-Uprising.pdf


Enhanced typesetting : Enabled
X-Ray : Enabled
Word Wise : Enabled
Print length : 302 pages

One of the key achievements of Bannon's tenure in the White House was his role
in developing Trump's "America First" agenda. This nationalist approach sought
to prioritize American interests above all else, from trade negotiations to foreign
policy decisions. Bannon argued that traditional globalism had neglected the
needs of ordinary Americans, leading to economic and cultural decline. This
message resonated with many disillusioned voters, especially those who felt left
behind by globalization.

However, Bannon's time in the spotlight was not without controversy. Critics
accused him of promoting white nationalist ideas or being connected to the alt-
right movement. While Bannon vehemently denied these allegations, his
association with far-right figures and his rhetoric on immigration fueled concerns
about the rise of extremism within the nationalist movement.

After leaving the White House, Bannon continued to advocate for his nationalist
agenda and support like-minded politicians around the world. He formed a
nonprofit organization called The Movement, which aimed to unite populist and
nationalist leaders in Europe. Bannon's efforts to export his brand of right-wing
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politics faced both criticism and support, as he became a central figure in the
ongoing struggle between globalism and nationalism.

The nationalist uprising, with Bannon at the forefront, also played a significant
role in shaping the global political landscape. The Brexit vote in the United
Kingdom, the rise of far-right parties in Europe, and the election of populist
leaders in countries like Brazil and Italy can be attributed, at least in part, to the
growing appeal of nationalism. While critics argue that this trend threatens
democratic norms and promotes division, supporters believe it represents a
necessary pushback against global elites and the erosion of national sovereignty.

In , Steve Bannon's role in the nationalist uprising, alongside his association with
Donald Trump, has continued to captivate and divide public opinion. Whether
seen as a champion of ordinary citizens or a controversial figure with a
dangerous agenda, Bannon's influence and the rise of nationalism cannot be
ignored. As the world navigates the complexities of nationalism versus globalism,
the consequences of this ongoing struggle will undoubtedly have a lasting impact
on future generations.
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The instant #1 New York Times bestseller.

From the reporter who was there at the very beginning comes the revealing
inside story of the partnership between Steve Bannon and Donald Trump—the
key to understanding the rise of the alt-right, the fall of Hillary Clinton, and the
hidden forces that drove the greatest upset in American political history.

Based on dozens of interviews conducted over six years, Green spins the master
narrative of the 2016 campaign from its origins in the far fringes of right-wing
politics and reality television to its culmination inside Trump’s penthouse on
election night.

The shocking elevation of Bannon to head Trump’s flagging presidential
campaign on August 17, 2016, hit political Washington like a thunderclap and
seemed to signal the meltdown of the Republican Party. Bannon was a bomb-
throwing pugilist who’d never run a campaign and was despised by Democrats
and Republicans alike. 

Yet Bannon’s hard-edged ethno-nationalism and his elaborate, years-long plot to
destroy Hillary Clinton paved the way for Trump’s unlikely victory. Trump became
the avatar of a dark but powerful worldview that dominated the airwaves and
spoke to voters whom others couldn’t see. Trump’s campaign was the final phase
of a populist insurgency that had been building up in America for years, and
Bannon, its inscrutable mastermind, believed it was the culmination of a hard-
right global uprising that would change the world.

Any study of Trump’s rise to the presidency is unavoidably a study of Bannon.
Devil’s Bargain is a tour-de-force telling of the remarkable confluence of
circumstances that decided the election, many of them orchestrated by Bannon
and his allies, who really did plot a vast, right-wing conspiracy to stop Clinton. To



understand Trump's extraordinary rise and Clinton’s fall, you have to weave
Trump’s story together with Bannon’s, or else it doesn't make sense.
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