
The Hidden History Of How The Internet Was
Used To Create Israel
When it comes to the creation of Israel, the role played by the internet may not be
the first thing that comes to mind. However, the internet has served as a powerful
tool to shape and support the formation of the modern state of Israel. In this
article, we will dive into the lesser-known history of how the internet played a
crucial role in the creation of Israel.

The Emergence of Digital Communication

The birth of the internet in the late 20th century revolutionized global
communication. It brought about unprecedented access to information and
transformed how individuals and communities connected with each other. One
lesser-known aspect of the internet's impact was its role in shaping the destiny of
Israel.

In the 1990s, as the internet gained popularity, it provided a platform for
spreading awareness about the Zionist movement and the history of Israel.
Previously, access to such information was limited to books and word-of-mouth,
but the internet democratized knowledge, making it easily accessible to people
around the world.
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Uniting a Dispersed Community

A significant challenge faced by the Jewish community prior to the creation of
Israel was their dispersion across different countries. The internet played a crucial
role in connecting and uniting this widespread community. Online forums,
websites, and social media platforms provided a virtual space for Jewish
individuals to share their stories, experiences, and aspirations.

Through these digital spaces, connections were formed, and a sense of unity
emerged among Jews from various corners of the world. The power of the
internet in fostering a shared identity and mobilizing people toward a common
goal cannot be underestimated.

The Power of Israel Advocacy Online

As the internet grew in popularity, so did its potential for advocacy. Israel
supporters recognized the importance of utilizing the digital realm to present their
narratives and counter anti-Israel sentiments. As a result, online resources and
platforms were developed to showcase the history, culture, and achievements of
Israel.

Advocacy organizations embraced the power of search engine optimization
(SEO) to ensure that when people sought information about Israel online, they
were exposed to positive and accurate content. This use of SEO helped to shape
online conversations and narratives surrounding Israel's legitimacy.
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Online Fundraising and Support

Another significant way the internet contributed to the creation of Israel was
through online fundraising and support. The establishment of Israel required
substantial financial resources, and the internet provided a convenient platform
for reaching out to supporters worldwide.

Crowdfunding campaigns, online donation platforms, and social media appeals
garnered support and enabled individuals from around the world to contribute
financially to the realization of the Zionist dream. The internet was instrumental in
connecting those who shared a vision for Israel's future, regardless of their
physical location.

Shaping Public Opinion and Diplomacy

The internet's influence on public opinion cannot be overstated. As news and
information became readily available online, people began to form their opinions
based on the content they consumed. This change in the media landscape
significantly impacted discussions surrounding Israel.

Online platforms served as a battleground for shaping public opinion, where
individuals, advocacy groups, and even governments engaged in diplomatic
debates and promoted their perspectives. The internet provided a platform for
Israel and its supporters to present their case directly to the public, bypassing
traditional media channels.

A Continuing Influence

The role of the internet in shaping the creation of Israel continues to this day. As
technology evolves, new tools and platforms emerge, providing even greater
potential for promoting Israel's narrative and connecting with supporters
worldwide.



The internet has transcended geographical boundaries and has played a
significant role in strengthening the bond between the Jewish community,
encouraging advocacy efforts, and shaping public opinion. The hidden history of
how the internet was used to create Israel reveals the transformative power of
digital communication in shaping the destiny of nations.

The creation of Israel was a complex and multifaceted process, with various
factors contributing to its realization. The internet, often overlooked in this
context, played a critical role in connecting people, shaping narratives, and
fostering support for Israel.

Understanding the hidden history of how the internet was used to create Israel
sheds light on the ever-evolving nature of communication and the significant
influence that digital platforms can have on shaping the destiny of nations in the
modern world.
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"Prodigiously documented... Alison Weir must be highly commended for throwing
such a brilliantly hard light on the relationship between the United States and
Israel. I hope this marvelous book gets all the attention it deserves." –
Ambassador Andrew Killgore

Soon after WWII, US statesman Dean Acheson warned that creating Israel on
land already inhabited by Palestinians would “imperil” both American and all
Western interests in the region. Despite warnings such as this one, President
Truman supported establishing a Jewish state on land primarily inhabited by
Muslims and Christians.

Few Americans today are aware that US support enabled the creation of modern
Israel. Even fewer know that US politicians pushed this policy over the forceful
objections of top diplomatic and military experts.

As this work demonstrates, these politicians were bombarded by a massive pro-
Israel lobbying effort that ranged from well-funded and very public Zionist
organizations to an “elitist secret society” whose members included Supreme
Court Justice Louis Brandeis.
AGAINST OUR BETTER JUDGMENT brings together meticulously sourced
evidence to illuminate a reality that differs starkly from the prevailing narrative. It
provides a clear view of the history that is key to understanding one of the most
critically important political issues of our day.

"This provocative book documents a history that is essential in understanding
today’s world. Scholarly, yet readable, it is a must for all Americans." – Senator
James Abourezk

"If you never read another book, read this one." – The Daily Kos diaries
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