
Unveiling the Secrets of Army Techniques
Publication ATP 01: Intelligence Preparation of
the Battlefield

When it comes to achieving victory on the battlefield, intelligence plays a crucial
role. The Army Techniques Publication ATP 01: Intelligence Preparation of the
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Battlefield is a seminal guide that shapes and empowers military strategists with
the necessary knowledge and tools to analyze and understand the complexities
of a battlefield.

The Essence of Intelligence Preparation of the Battlefield

Intelligence preparation of the battlefield (IPB) is a comprehensive process that
aims to provide commanders with an accurate understanding of the operational
environment. Undoubtedly, it is one of the most critical and decisive aspects of
military planning and execution. ATP 01 serves as the foundation and guiding
principle for the IPB process within the United States Army. From understanding
the terrain and weather conditions to studying the enemy forces and their
capabilities, this document paves the way for successful military operations.
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ATP 01 consists of several chapters that meticulously detail each step of the IPB
process. These chapters include:

1. : Understanding the importance of IPB and its role in decision-making.

2. Step 1: Define the Battlefield Environment: Exploring the terrain, weather,
and other physical components that affect military operations.

3. Step 2: Describe the Battlefield's Effects: Evaluating the influence of the
battlefield on friendly and enemy forces.

4. Step 3: Evaluate the Threat: Analyzing the enemy forces, their organization,
capabilities, tactics, and most importantly, their intentions.

5. Step 4: Determine Threat COAs: Considering various courses of action
(COAs) the enemy may adopt and their potential impacts.

6. Step 5: Determine Threat's Most Likely COA: Identifying the most probable
COA the enemy will employ based on the available information.

7. Step 6: Determine the Threat's Most Dangerous COA: Determining the COA
that poses the gravest threat to friendly forces.

8. Step 7: Evaluate the Threat Situation: Summarizing the intelligence gathered
to develop a thorough threat assessment.

9. Step 8: Develop Friendly COAs: Formulating the best possible courses of
action for friendly forces.

10. Step 9: Analyze Friendly COAs: Assessing the strengths and weaknesses of
each friendly COA.

11. Step 10: Compare Friendly COAs: Comparing the different friendly COAs to
identify the most effective one.

12. : Summarizing the IPB process and its impact on military operations.



The Benefits and Applications of ATP 01

Army Techniques Publication ATP 01 provides invaluable benefits to military
commanders and staff officers. By following the guidelines outlined in this
document, they can enhance their situational awareness and decision-making
capabilities. The IPB process, when properly executed, minimizes risks,
rationalizes resource allocation, and maximizes operational efficiency. ATP 01 is
not only utilized during the planning stage of military operations but also during
ongoing missions to adapt to unforeseen circumstances effectively.

Gaining the Upper Hand With ATP 01

ATP 01 serves as a comprehensive and systematic guide that equips military
personnel with the knowledge and skills required to analyze the battlefield
thoroughly. It empowers them to identify potential threats, develop effective
strategies, and ultimately achieve victory. The intelligence garnered through the
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IPB process allows commanders to gain the upper hand and exploit enemy
weaknesses while leveraging their own strengths.

Army Techniques Publication ATP 01: Intelligence Preparation of the Battlefield is
an essential resource that encompasses the intricate process of analyzing the
battlefield. By following the guidelines laid out in this document, military
commanders are equipped with the necessary tools to make informed decisions
that can ultimately shape the outcome of a conflict. ATP 01 serves as a testament
to the significance of intelligence in military operations and highlights its role in
ensuring the safety and success of our armed forces.
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This United States Army manual, Army Techniques Publication ATP 2-01.3
Intelligence Preparation of the Battlefield Change 1 January 2021, constitutes
current doctrine on how to systematically evaluate the effects of significant
characteristics of the operational environment (OE) for specific missions. This
publication— Describes how the commander and staff examine mission variables
to understand how these variables may affect operations; Discusses intelligence
preparation of the battlefield (IPB) as a critical component of the military decision-
making process, how IPB supports decision making, and the integrating
processes; Facilitates a common understanding, foundational concepts, and
methods of the IPB process. The principal audience for ATP 2-01.3 is tactical
Army commanders and staffs. Commanders and staffs of Army headquarters
serving as a joint task force or a multinational headquarters also refer to
applicable joint or multinational doctrine related to IPB. Trainers and educators
throughout the Army also use this publication. ATP 2-01.3 uses joint terms where
applicable. Selected joint and Army terms and definitions appear in both the
glossary and the text. Terms for which ATP 2-01.3 is the proponent publication
(the authority) are marked with an asterisk (*) in the glossary. Definitions for
which ATP 2-01.3 is the proponent publication are boldfaced in the text. For other
definitions shown in the text, the term is italicized and the number of the
proponent publication follows the definition. This manual applies to intelligence
activities conducted outside the United States. Intelligence activities conducted
inside the United States, as well as those that target U.S. persons and groups
outside the United States, invoke additional requirements and intelligence
oversight rules. To the extent any of the activities described in this publication are
conducted inside the United States, or target U.S. persons or groups outside the
United States, consult the judge advocate for assistance. ATP 2-01.3 applies to
the Active Army, the Army National Guard/Army National Guard of the United
States, U.S. Army Reserve, unless otherwise stated.
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